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How important is the physical workplace to engagement and productivity? 
 

Work engagement is a relatively recent concept, research into which has only recently begun 
to emerge. Engagement has been described as a positive, fulfilling state of work related 
wellbeing, regarded by some as the antipode of burnout (Bakker et al., 2008). Engaged 
employees are highly energetic (vigour), feel pride and enthusiasm (dedication) and are able 
to focus completely on the task (absorption) (Wildermuth and Pauken, 2008). Vigour is 
characterised by high energy levels and mental resilience; dedication refers to being strongly 
involved in work and experiencing a sense of significance, enthusiasm and challenge, while 
absorption is characterised by being fully concentrated and happily engrossed, whereby time 
passes quickly (Bakker and Demerouti, 2007). 
 
Research linking engagement to job performance has now begun to emerge and, while in its 
infancy, the published studies suggest a positive correlation between engagement and 
performance. A strategic facet of facilities management is to assist businesses to operate in an 
efficient and profitable manner and FM, therefore, could have a position at the forefront of 
engagement research. 
 
According to Bakker et al. (2008), it has consistently been shown that job resources are 
positively associated with work engagement. These resources include factors such as social 
support from colleagues and supervisors, performance feedback, skill variety, autonomy and 
learning opportunities. 
 
Job resources are physical, psychological, social or organisational aspects of the job that are 
functional in achieving work goals or reduce job demands and the associated physiological 
and psychological costs, or stimulate personal growth, learning and development (Bakker and 
Demerouti, 2007; Schaufeli and Bakker, 2004). 
 
Therefore, job resources may be an intrinsic motivator in that they fulfil basic human needs 
such as autonomy, relatedness and competence (Bakker et al., 2008). An extrinsic 
motivational role may also be played by job resources because work environments offering 
many resources foster willingness to dedicate effort and abilities, increasing the likelihood of 
tasks being completed successfully and that work goals will be attained (Bakker et al., 2008). 
 
Bakker and Demerouti (2007) highlight that whether through the satisfaction of basic needs 
or through achievement of work goals, the presence of job resources leads to engagement, 
while their absence evokes a cynical attitude towards work. Therefore, a favourable physical 
working environment could be a key job resource, helping to facilitate engagement. 
 
Literature on the relationship between engagement and performance is relatively scarce. 
However, results of several studies look promising (Bakker et al., 2008). Engaged workers 
tend to perform better (Bakker et al., 2008), give their all to their jobs and are willing to go 
the extra mile to achieve success (Wildermuth and Pauken, 2008). 
 
According to Bakker et al. (2008), there are four reasons why engaged workers perform 
better. Engaged employees often experience positive emotions including happiness, joy and 
enthusiasm; they experience better health (physical and psychological); they create their own 



job and personal resources (e.g. support from others); and they transfer their engagement to 
others. 
 
Positive emotions broaden the thought-action repertoire, performance is facilitated by good 
health as individuals can use all their physical and mental resources and employees who 
create their own resources are able to deal better with job demands and to achieve work goals 
(Bakker et al., 2008). Further to this they make the point that performance, in most 
organisations, is the result of the combined efforts of individual employees. Therefore, it is 
conceivable that the crossover of engagement among members of the same work team 
increases performance. 
 
Most researchers have not made the distinction between in-role and extra-role performance, 
although this is considered by Bakker et al. (2004). They define in-role performance as 
officially required outcomes and behaviours that directly serve organisational goals, 
including meeting organisational objectives and effective functioning. Additionally, 
employees may display extra-role activities, defined as discretionary behaviours, believed to 
directly promote the effective functioning of an organisation without necessarily directly 
influencing an individual’s target productivity. Examples given are willingness to help 
colleagues who have heavy workloads or avoidance of problems with colleagues. 
 
Bakker et al. (2004) demonstrated that engaged employees received higher ratings from their 
colleagues on in-role and extra-role performance, which is an indication that engaged 
employees perform well (Bakker et al., 2008). 
 
Is it possible or likely then that the physical workplace has a significant impact upon 
engagement and hence, work performance? It could be argued that the workplace is an 
intrinsic job factor and constitutes a resource, which would be positively associated with 
work engagement. As one of many contributory resources, a high quality working 
environment should contribute to an engaged, and hence, productive workforce. In the same 
way, a poor quality working environment could be a detracting factor from an engaged 
workforce. 
 
Research into these linkages is required in this developing field and it would appear that there 
is an opportunity for the FM profession to make a major strategic contribution. 
 
Andrew Smith 
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